P.R. No. 13961
Amended 2/13-14/2007 gt

RESOLUTION N0.07 ’OQQ; )

A RESOLUTION APPROVING INVOICES OF THE
CITY OF PORT ARTHUR SECTION 4A ECONOMIC
DEVELOPMENT CORPORATION FOR LEGAL
SERVICES RENDERED THROUGH JANUARY 11,
2007 BY GERMER GERTZ, LLP.
WHEREAS, the City Council approved Ordinance No. 04-61 and Resolution
No. 05-163 pertaining to the payment process of the City Port Arthur Section 4A
Economic Development Corporation; and
WHEREAS, the invoices denoted in Exhibit “A” were approved by the Board of
Directors of the City of Port Arthur Section 4A Economic Development Corporation at
their February 7, 2007 meeting; and
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF
THE CITY OF PORT ARTHUR:
Section 1. That the facts and opinions in the preamble are true and correct.
Section 2. That the invoices denoted in Exhibit “A” is hereby approved.
Section 3. That the City Council approves the continued usage of Germer Gertz

so long as:

1. their hourly rates do not exceed the rates, as denoted in their Agreement,
as approved by Resolution No. 05-117.

2. their bills do not exceed the City of Port Arthur Section 4A Economic
Development Corporation’s budget for legal services; and

3. the City of Port Arthur Section 4A Economic Development Corporation

can terminate the agreement with thirty (30) days written notice.
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Section 4. That a copy of the caption of the Resolution be spread upon the
Minutes of the City Council.

READ, ADOPTED AND APPROVED ON THE [ day of %/‘ uUa /ﬂ

A.D. 2007, at a Regular Meeting of the City Council of the City of Port Arthur, Texas by
the following vote:

AYES:

Mayor;%o [am Pﬁ NC

CityCouncil: }’\Q/bUIS %ar )i@r” _Ffood 6@@(‘ d
Williamsos. andd omczﬁol

NOES: (DO UN T l ma)”Y\}OZF HC/)/\CJCL?WS dn_

M/m }OWJ

MAYOR PRO TEM PRINCE

/,w,(, %/&/

x%)(LINE GREEN, CITY SECRETARY

?Q,@/-/ﬁf—a

il e

FLOYD BATISTE, EDC CEO

APPROVED:

—

APPROVED AS TO FORM:

(SEE CONFIDENTIAL MEMO)
MARK T. SOKOLOW, CITY ATTORNEY
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EXHIBIT “A”



\X
P \ﬁp\
Q&}, Germer Gertz, L.L.P. From 01/11/07
Invoices by Client Thru 01/11/07
Client Name Date Inveice Total Fees Cost Credits  Balance
CITPOR Port Arthur EDC
56257 Economic Development Corpora  01/11/07 305417 4,555.48 4,502.50 5298 0.00 4,555.48
Matter Totals 4,555.48 4,502.50 52.98 0.00 4,555.48
68952 City of Port Arthur Section 4A E 01/11/07 305421 372,36 337.50 34.86 0.00 372.36
Matter Totals 372.36 337.50 34.86 0.00 372.36
69684 Camellia Plaza, L.P. 01/11/07 305340 187.50 187.50 0.00 0.00 187.50
Matter Totals 187.50 187.50 0.00 0.00 187.50
69709 Spur 93 Business Park 01/11/07 305341 462.50 462.50 0.00 0.00 462.50
Matter Totals 462.50 462.50 0.00 0.00 462.50
69805 SETX Clearwater Environmenta ~ 01/11/07 305342 62.50 62.50 0.00 0.00 62.50
Matter Totals 62.50 62.50 0.00 0.00 62.50
69877 EcoDiesel Industries, LLC 01/11/07 305343 812.50 812.50 0.00 0.00 812.50
Matter Totals 812.50 812.50 0.00 0.00 812.50
70424 Mec-00, Inc. d/bfa Mc-O Constr ~ 01/11/07 305344 75.00 75.00 0.00 0.00 75.00
Matter Totals 75.00 75.00 0.00 0.00 75.00
70435 Pleasure Island Shrimp House, [ 01/11/07 305345 1,820.43 1,800.00 20.43 ¢.00 1,820.43
Matter Totals 1,820.43 1,800.00 20.43 0.00 1,820.43
70834 Del Pueblo Foods, USA, Inc. d/b  01/11/07 305346 100.00 100.00 0.00 0.00 100.00
Matter Totals 100.00 100.00 0.00 0.00 100.00
70835 Lamar State College-Port Arthur ~ 01/11/07 305347 425.00 425.00 0.00 0.00 425.00
Matter Totals 425.00 425.00 0.00 0.00 425.00
70966 Desselle-Maggard Corporation 01/11/07 305348 725.00 725.00 0.00 0.00 725.00
Matter Totals 725.00 725.00 0.00 0.00 725.00
Firm Totals 9,598.27 9,490.00 108.27 0.00  9,598.27
Billing-240A by dawnh Page 1 of 1 01/12/07 11:39 AM



Germer Gertz, L.L.P.

P.O. Box 4915
Beaumont, Texas 77704
409-654-6700
Tax ID # 76-0445148
January 11, 2007

Port Arthur EDC

P.O. Box 3934

4173 39th Street

Port Arthur, TX 77642

Attn: Chief Executive Officer

Invoice No.
305417

Re: Economic Development Corporation (CITPOR-56257)

Professional Services Through 12/31/06

As per Time Exhibit Attached........coooiicinmi e
Total Costs (a8 SROWN BElOW): v mniinimiistimissmme s

TOtAl JIVOICE. 1o vecrsveresevssrramsatossoisissressrssstsssnssassrssbiessssssssssastossasassmensivnssssas

Prior ATNOUNE DUE.....oiieeieerrarissisrnis st ses s st es s st bnns s s

|nvolce Date;  involce #: Balance
0622106 282790 £.213.57 |
12/20/06 304467 4,634.36 E

Total AMOUNE DUCecervrercersiessmsssenimimnmisncsssstsansssss st seassaaasans

Costs Through 12/31/06

12/04/06 Long distance service for November 2006 - AT&T Long
Distance

12/13/06 Travel to and from Port Arthur, Texas (4} miles) for EDC
Board meeting - Robin M. Woolridge

12/26/06 Travel to Nederland/Port Arthur/Bridge City on
12/20/06 - Adam Cohrs

Copying Expense 37 @ 025

Postage Expense

TR CCOSES. cvvrvevreevmressersseserertmsensemsr s S sssars b e

....................... 52.98

---------------------

$4,502.50

4,555.48

$9,847.93

$14,403.41

14.96
17.80

8.90

52.98
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Time Exhibit

Re: Economic Development Corporation (CITPOR-56257) Invoice No.
Invoice for services rendered through 12/31/06 305417
Date Initials Work Description Hours Rate

12/01/06 RMC  Begin preparing response to PAEDC auditors regarding pending 1.50 125.00 187.50
and possible lawsuits

12/01/06 GNG  Telephone conference with Executive Director; 0.50 150.00 75.00

12/04/06 RMC Complete reviewing EDC contract with Arceneaux and Gates 1,70 125.00 212.50
Consulting Engineers

12/04/06 RMC Begin preparing letter to PAEDC auditors to inform of pending 240 125.00 300.00
and potential lawsuits on behalf of the PAEDC

12/05/06 RMC Continue drafting EDC audit response letter 340 125.00 425.00

12/05/06 RMC  Correspond with Floyd Batiste regarding DMC contract 030 12500 3750
corrections and applications

12/06/06 RMC Conference with Floyd Batiste regarding upcoming EDC board 0.50 12500 62.50
meeting and agenda :

12/07/06 RMC  Receive and review agenda and attachments for upcoming EDC 120  125.00 150.00
board meeting

12/07/06 RMC DMC - Revise incentive agreement and send to Floyd for 0.80 125.00 100.00
forwarding to DMC for review

12/11/06 RMC  Receive and review Summary Judgment and Brief filed on 1.00  125.00 125.00
behalf of PAEDC in the Tke Mills lawsuit

12/11/66 RMC  Continue preparing response to audit letter on behalf of PAEDC 200 12500 250.00
detailing any and all ongoing and potential lawsuits

12/11/06 RCR  Prepare notebook for Robin Cummings to attend the meeting on 0.30 50.00 15.00
December 13, 2006 with the EDC

12/11/06 GNG  Telephone conference with client on pending matters related to 1.50 150.00 225.00
Jana Bames;

12/13/06 RMC  Travel to, attend, and participate in EDC board meeting 470  125.00 587.50

12/13/06 RMC  Prepare letter to Jana Bames and attorney James Makin 0.50 12500 62.50
scheduling meeting with Jana Bares for disciplinary allegations

12/15/06 RMC Conference with Floyd Batiste and Carine Figueroa regarding 070 125.00 87.50
EDC annual meeting and NDC invoice

12/15/06 RMC  Correspond with Adam Cohrs and Lindsay Randolph regarding 0.50 125.00 62.50
EDC files from City Attorney's office

12/15/06 GNG  Telephone conference with Executive Director on various 0.50 150.00 75.00

matters;
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Date

Initials

Time Exhibit

Re: Ecanomic Development Corporation (CITPOR-56257)

Invoice for services rendered through 12/31/06

Work Description

Hours

Rate

Invoice No.
305417

12/18/06

12/18/06

12/19/06

12/19/06

12/19/06

12/20/06

12/20/06

RMC

RMC

RMC

RMC

GNG

Prepare and revise EDC Incentive Agreement Flowchart for
discussion at City Council meeting; correspond with Mark
Sokolow regarding EDC Incentive Agreement Flowchart
regarding revisions

Correspond with Lindsay Randolph and Misty Muse regarding
files from City of Port Arthur as to EDC that are currently in
storage

Conference with Guy Goodson regarding ail EDC pending
matters including Pleasure Island Shrimp House, Jade Ave.
Extension, Dr. Ally, Arceneaux and Gates, and third party for
EDC applicant evaluation

Meet and conference with Mark Sokolow, City of Port Arthur
Attorney, regarding development and revising of Incentive
Agreement Flowchart for use by EDC and City

Preparation for Board meeting; meeting with co-counsel;
telephone conference with Executive Director on employee

issues,

Prepare letter to Floyd Batiste with Decermber mid-month cost
analysis

Telephone conference with client on agenda items and
discussion of contract revisions,

Total Hours

2.60

0.60

1.00

4.60

1.00

0.50

1.00

35.30

125.00

125.00

125.00

125.00

150.00

125.00

150.00

325.00

75.00

125.00

575.00

150.00

62.50

150.00
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Time Allocation Exhibit

Re: Economic Development Corporation (CITPOR-56257) Invoice No.
Invoice for services rendered through 12/31/06 305417
Timekeeper Name Hours Rate Fee D
Guy N. Goodson Partner 4.50 156.00 $675.00 GNG
Renee C. Roberts Paralegal 0.30 50.00 $15.00 RCR
Robin M. Cumnmings Associate 30.50 125.00 $3,81250 RMC
Totals 35.30 $4.502.50
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Time Exhibit
Re: Lamar State Coliege-Port Arthur (CITPOR-70835)
Invoice for services rendered through 12/31/66

Invoice No.
305347

Date Initials  Work Description Hours Rate

12/04/06 RMC  Preparation of Training Grant Agreement between PAEDC and 3.40 12500 425.00

Lamar State College-Port Arthur

Total Hours 3.40
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Time Allocation Exhibit
Re: Lamar State College-Port Arthur (CITPOR-70835) Invoice No.
Invoice for services rendered through 12/31/06 305347

Timekeeper Name Hours Rate Fee ID
Robin M. Curnmings Associate 3.40 125.00 $425.00 RMC
Totals 3.40 $425.00
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%
oF
Germer Gertz, L.L.P. Q\\f«'f
P.0. Box 4915 Qg&
Beaumnont, Texas 77704 Invoice No.
409-654-6700 305348
Tax ID # 76-0445148
January 11, 2007

Port Arthur EDC
P.O. Box 3934
4173 39th Street
Port Arthur, TX 77642
Attn: Chief Executive Officer
Re: Desselle-Maggard Corporation (CITPOR-70966)

Professional Services Through 12/31/06

As per Time Exhibit AHACHEA. ....coccoirrriirmmmernin s $725.00

Total Costs (as shown below}: oo v TP PO USROS IRIOR 0.00

T OTAL TIVORCEserrravserrsarsrssssnsassessensensnsassssississrssssninest st es sessssssnassesstesssntasbsnnniiasssssintasrases: 725.00

Costs Through 12/31/06
0.00

TOLAL COSLS. .- vveeereeearesersesemssessesinmessmasa s seia ey eSS
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Time Exhibit

Re: Desselle-Maggard Corporation (CITPOR-70966) Invoice No.
Invoice for services rendered through 12/31/06 305348
Date Initials Work Description Hours Rate
12/12/06 RMC  Attend and participate in conference call with DMC managers to 1.00  125.00 125.00
discuss and negotiate contract
12/12/06 RMC Review revised contract from DMC legal counsel 1.00 125.00 125.00
12/13/06 RMC Review DMC contract from Charles Schutte, attorney for DMC,; 1.00  125.00 125.00
correspond with Floyd Batiste regarding concerns of DMC
contract; correspond with Charles Schutte regarding DMC
coniract
12/18/06 RMC  Revise Incentive Agreement. 100 12500 125.00
12/19/06 RMC  Agreement with DMC. 0.80 125.00 100.00
12/20/06 RMC  Revise DMC incentive agreement 1.00 12500 125.00
5.80

Total Hours
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Time Allocation Exhibit
Envoice No.

Re: Desselle-Maggard Corporation (CITPOR-70966)
[nvoice for services rendered through 12/3 1/06 305348

Timekeeper Name Hours Rate Fee ID
Robin M. Cummings Associate 5.80 125.00 $725.00 RMC
Totals 5.80 $725.00
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