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RESOION NO 0
AIESOLUTION AS IT PERTAINS TO THE CITY OF

PORT ARTHUR SECTION 4A ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT

CORPORATION PAYING AN INVOICE OF 904274
FROM THE LABICHE ARCHITECTURAL GROUP INC

WHEREAS the CEO of the EDC signed an agreement with LaBiche

Architectural Group Inc as denoted in Exhibit A and

WHEREAS the Board of Directors approved the invoice for

904274 on August 22 2007 attached hereto as Exhibit B and

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY

OF PORT ARTHUR TEXAS

Section 1 That the facts and opinions in the preamble are

true and correct

Section 2 NThat the City Council approves the invoice of

904274 as describe in Exhibit B

Section 3 That nbdditional work shall be performed by

LaBiche Architectural Group Inc on this matter until additional

approval is obtained by the City Council

Section 4 That a copy of the caption of this Resolution

be spread upon the Minutes of the City Council

OPTD PROVED on this

C AD 2007 at a Meeting of the City Council of

t ity of Port Arthur Texas by the following vote AYES

zpr14342



Mayor

Councilmembers

ATTEST

APPROVED AS TO FORM

SEE CONFIDENTIAL MEMO

CITY ATTORNEY

APPROVED FOR ADMINISTRATION

CITY MANAGER

zpr14342



EXHI B IT



The

LaBiche

Architectural

Group Inc

Dohn H La13iche AiA Plesident

Greg Wall AIA

7999 Gladys Avenue Suite 101

Beaumont Texas 77706

4098600197fax4098600198

DATE August 24 2007

TO Mark Sokolou

ATIN

FROM D otto LaBmlxe

RE Signed Agreement for Port Arthur Economic Development
NO OF PAGES

Including Cover Sheet 3

This message is intended only for the use ofthe 1ndixddual or enfitT to whom it is addressed and may
contain informatonthat is pdvleged confidential and exempt from disclosure under applicable law
If the reader of this message is not the intended recipient or the employee or agent responsible for
deiivermg the message to the intended recipieaat you aehexeby notified that any dissemination
distribution or copying of dtis cotmnunicatonis strctl7 prohibited If you have received this
communication in error please notify us mediately by telephone 2adetum the original message to
us at the above address Thank You

FAX TRANSMITTAL COVER SHEET
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The

LaBiche

Architectural

Group Inc

lohn H LaBiche AIA

Ptesident

Grog Wall AIA

409060097

pROJECT
CONSULTING

PLANNING

INTFRIOR
DSIGN

April 3 2007

Mr Floyd Batiste
Port Arthur Economic Development Corporation
4173 39 Street

Port Arthur TX 77642

Re Renovations to the South Tower Port Arthur International Seafarers Center
401 Houston Avenue Port Arthur Texas

Dear Mr Batiste

In accordance with our conversation we propose to render architectural services
including modification of three floors of the Port Arthur International Seafarers Center
into offices for the Port Arthur Economic Development Corporation and addition of a

stairway and elevator as follows

BASIC COMPENSATION Nine Percent9of the construction cost

ADDITIONAL SERVICES OF THE ARCHITECT Hourly See attached Rate

Schedule

ADDITIONAL SERVICFSOF CONSULTANTS Multiple of125times the amount
billed to the Architect

REIMBURSABLE EXPENSE Multiple of125times the reimbursable expenses
incurred by the Architect

If this agreement is satisfactory to you please sign and return one copy to our office

Sincerely

Dohn H LaBiche AIA

DHLjc
APPROVED BY

Date



U024 20I1045

HOII Y RATE CHFf31JLE Mv nflT

Principal

Senior Project Architect

Project Architect

Intern Architect II

Intern Architect

Interior Finish Consultant II

Interior Finish Consultant J

Secretarial

HOURLY RATE

12500

10000

8500

8500

8000

6500

3500

4500

The rates for services of the Architect as set forth in this Agreement shall be adjusted in
accordance with their normal salary review practices

The Texas Beard of ArchffchraExaminers has lurisdlction overcomplaints regarding the profeesione
pmctcesof person roglsfered a architects in Texa

POBox 2337



EXHIBIT B



LaBiche

Architectural

Group Inc

Dolm H LaBiche
Preddent

GtegWaB AIA

August 13 2007

4098600198

ARCH1TICIURIE

CONSULTING

PLANNING

INTERIOR

DSON

Mr Floyd Batiste
Port Arthur Economic Der Corp
4173 39th Street
Port Arthur TX 77642

RE City of Port Arthur SeafarersCenter

Dear Mr Batiste

Enclosed is our Invoice No 0700701 in the amount of 904274 for
architectural services rendered through July 312007

Sincerely

Dohn H LaBiche AIA

DHLjc

Enclosures



Port Arthur Economic Dev Corp
4173 39th Street
Port Arthur TX 77642

Date August 13 2007

Invoice No 0700701

Project No 07007

Attn Mr Floyd Batiste

Re City of Port Arthur SeafarersCenter

For professional services rendered for the period July 1 2007 to July 31 2007
for the referenced project

Construction Cost 402700
Basic Compensation 900 36243

of Contraot Work Amount Previous This Inv
Description Contract Amount To Date Billed Billed Bi

Schematic Design t5 543845 100 543645 000 543645
Design Development 20 724860 25 181215 006 18t15Conetmctron DOCuments 40 1449720 0 O00 000 000
Bidding Negotiations 5 181215 0 000 000 000
Construction 20 724860 0 000 O00 000

100 3824300 724860 000 724850
TOTAL BASIC FEE 724880

REIMBURSABLE EXPENSES

Federal Express Corp 125 X 2531 3164

TOTAL REIMBUREABIEEXPENSES 3164

ADDITIONAL SERVICES

Lechtenbsrg Consulting 125 X 141000 176250

TOTAL ADDITIONAL SERVICES

INVOICE TOTAL

176250

904274

The LaBlche Architectural Group Inc
7999 Oladye Suite 101 Beaumont TX 77706

4098600197 fax 4098600198



Invoice No 0700701

Project No 07007

PROJECT TO DATE SUMMARY

Basic Fees

Reimbursable Expenses
Additional Services

TOTAL NOWDUE

STATEMENT OF ACCOUNT
Invoice Date

Total Billing to Date

Less Amount Received

724860
3164

176250

904274
000

904274

Amount

0700701 08132007
904274

904274

The Texas Board of Amhitectural Examiners has jurlsdictinn overcomplaints regarding the
professional practices of persons registered as architects In Texas

Texas Board of Architectural Examiners

POBOX 12337

AustintX 787112337

Telephone 51230590901Fax 5123058900

The LaBIche Architectural Group Inc
7999 Gladye Sute 101 Beaumont TX 7770ES

4098600197 fax4098600198



I Invoice Number Flayice Date Accii4e Page208054278 J Jun072007 106437092 J 6of6

i

recliJng ID 84128778 GLEN A 6UIUNG
ServiCe Type FedPdor Overnight BICHEARITECTURAL 6RP
PBckage Type FedEx Tube 99GYA STE 10
Ze 02 8EAUMONT 77731USPackges
R Weight 20 lbs09kgs
Ooflvred Jun 214 TransoargeSVG ea Fuel Surcharge
ndd by CRGUERA Cougar Pickup Charge
Fed Use 015511 TolChae

Recipient
FLOYD BATISTE
PORTARTHUR EDC
417339THT
PORTAITHUR 1 77642 US

1830
301

Shipperhtnf USD 10317
Total FedEx Express USD 10312



L E 19 H T E N B E R G

LECHTENBRGCONSULTING INC

PO Box 6483
Lake Charles LA 70606

Invoice

LaBiche Architectural Group
7999 Gladys
Suite 101

Beaumont TX 77706

07019 Port Arthur EDC Renovations

Terms

et30

Description r oty Amount

Principal Electrical Engineering Services at90hr 7 63000
Drafting Services at 40hr 105 42000
Sr Mechanical Engineering Services at 901hr 4 36000

Work ending July 29 2007
Total 141000


